CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK BID SUMMARY

Bid Number: 15-3349 Date: July 21,2015 @ 10:00 am
OPENED BY: Amy Smith SUMMARY BY: Crystal Willis
DEMO/SITE CLEARANCE AT 6 A Demolition Vic's Excavating Benson & Moyer
LOCATIONS Company Construction Services Company Excavating
Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor’s License Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Locations l Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount
3000.00 3382.50 2160.00 NO BID 5750.00
601 Prothro  $
1012 East 2™ Street $ 2800.00 4122.00 3750.00 NO BID 8500.00
105 Davis  $ 3300.00 3690.00 3600.00 NO BID 6850.00
2900.00 3075.00 2750.00 NO BID 6500.00
2222 East 2™ Street  $
9750.00 4550.00 4500.00 NO BID 8690.00
1923 Pike Ave  $
599 West 22" Street$ 14,700.00 12,000.00 10,500.00 33,341.00 24,607.50
Present at Bid Opening No No No Yes Yes
Liability Insurance Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




