CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK BID SUMMARY

Bid Number: 16-3391 Date: July 12,2016 @ 10:00 am
OPENED BY: Amy Smith SUMMARY BY: Crystal Willis
DEMO/SITE CLEARANCE AT 5 A Demolition BTS One Shot Robert Excavation &
LOCATIONS Demolition Construction Mclntosh Demolition
Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor’s License Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Locations l Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount
1604 Schaer  $ 2800.00 3200.00 3400.00 No Bid 4350.00
119 East 14 $ 5700.00 7550.00 12,500.00 9535.00 9500.00
4523 Boyer  $ 3700.00 No Bid 3400.00 No Bid 5496.00
; 3300.00 No Bid 2000.00 5865.00 1950.00
826 West 23" $
3700.00 4975.00 3400.00 No Bid 4449.00
920 Graham $
Present at Bid Opening Yes
Liability Insurance Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK BID SUMMARY

Bid Number: 16-3391 Date: July 12,2016 @ 10:00 am
OPENED BY: Amy Smith SUMMARY BY: Crystal Willis
DEMOY/SITE CLEARANCE AT 5 G Hoops
LOCATIONS
Bid Bond Yes
Contractor’s License Yes
Locations l Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount
1604 Schaer $ 4825.00
119 East 14" $ 22,000.00
4523 Boyer $| 710000
; 4700.00
826 West 239 $
7100.00
920 Graham $
Present at Bid Opening
Liability Insurance Yes




